
  

  

FOI 3055 

Date 28/06/2024 

 

Dear Requester, 

Thank you for your Freedom of Information request. Please note, this is a cross-site response for 

Bedford site and Luton site. 

 

You asked: 

1. Does your Eye Service/A&E service offer Emergency/Casualty Eye Care by walk-in, 
telephone or self-referral? If so, can you please state if it is walk-in, telephone or self-
referral based and can you provide activity data for each of the last 5 years (2018/19, 
2019/20, 2020/21, 2021/22, 2022/23) 
 
Both Bedford and Luton eye clinics do not provide appt by walkin self referral or telephone. 
 

 
2. Number of Adult Patients attending, in each year, in the age groups of, 18 to 24; 25 to 

34; 35 to 49; 50 to 64; over 65 
 

 18-24 25-34 35-49 50-64 65 or 
above 

2018/19 250 599 894 1281 1455 

2019/20 223 559 907 1240 1320 

2020/21 185 546 748 1012 1237 

2021/22 350 689 992 1319 1512 

2022/23 299 798 1126 1324 1665 
 

 

 
3. Number of Adult Patients attending, in each year, split by Casualty/A&E Triage 

Category of 3, 4 & 5 (we have intentionally excluded Category 1 & 2 from this FOI) 
 
Data not held 

 
4. Number of Adult Patients transferred/onward referred, in each year, to the Outpatient 

Eye clinic for ongoing care? 
 

Data not held 

 

This information is provided for your personal use and is the property of Bedfordshire Hospitals 

NHS Trust and subject to any existing Intellectual Property and Database Rights. Any commercial 

application or use of this information may be subject to the provisions of the Re-use of Public 

Sector Information Regulations 2015 (RPSI). This means that if you wish to re-use the information 

provided for commercial purposes for any reason you must ask the Trust for permission to do so.  



  

  

 Please note that the Trust has a formal internal review and complaints process which is managed 

by the Information Governance Manager/Data Protection Officer. Should you have any concerns 

with our response, you can make a formal request for an internal review. Requests for internal 

review should be submitted within three months of the date of receipt of the response to your 

original letter, and should be addressed to: dataprotectionofficer@ldh.nhs.uk. This option is 

available to you for up to three calendar months from the date your response was issued.  

If you are not satisfied with the Trust review under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 you may 

apply directly to the Information Commissioners Officer (ICO) for a review of your appeal decision. 

The ICO can be contacted at: ICO, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF 

www.ico.org.uk  

 Yours sincerely,  

 

 FOI Officer 

 Bedfordshire Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust 

 

 


